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YIRGINIA'S BUS COMPANY

VIRGINIA SCHOOL BUSES

Contract No. E194-1413

Commonwealth of Virginia
Department of General Services
Price Bid

$ Type A Pricing




Type A Pricing

1. Option Description: 16 Passenger Base
Bus (Gasoline Engine - must have
Automatic Fire Suppression System - V8
Mini

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

11010
$45,988.00

11t0 20
$45,738.00

21to 50
$45,488.00

50 +
$45,488.00

2. Option Description: 16 Passenger Base
Bus (Diesel Engine)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$53,900.00

11t0 20
$53,650.00

21to 50
$53,400.00

50 +
$53,400.00

3. Option Description: 24 Passenger Base
Bus (Gasoline engine - must have
Automatic Fire Suppression VA Minimum)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$46,225.00

1110 20
$45,975.00

21to 50
$45,775.00

50 +
$45,775.00

4. Option Description: 24 Passenger Base
(Diesel Engine)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
$54,125.00

1110 20
$53,875.00

21to 50
$53,625.00

50 +
$53,625.00
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Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount
OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW
Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50

Instructions: The Option Items can be submitted on a separate Excel spreadsheet using the head titles above.
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Type A 16 Passenger Gas

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
AM/FM CD Player B260401100 $552.00 25.00% $414.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401101 $606.00 25.00% $455.00
Exterior Speaker for PA B258005000 $161.00 25.00% $121.00
Child Reminder System B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Electric Powered Entrance Door B50360M000 $919.00 25.00% $689.00
Extended Length Body 051MS $2,045.00 25.00% $1,534.00
White Roof D50610F041 $662.00 25.00% $497.00
Tinted Glass B161101041 $140.00 25.00% $105.00
Seat Belt Ready Seat Frames B641539000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Seat Belts(each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door)* B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door)* B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Sure-Lok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
14,200 GVWR (includes chassis) B548969000 $3,062.00 25.00% $2,297.00
*Requires Extended Body Option
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type A 16 Passenger Diesel

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
AM/FM CD Player B260401100 $552.00 25.00% $414.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401101 $606.00 25.00% $455.00
Exterior Speaker for PA B258005000 $161.00 25.00% $121.00
Child Reminder System B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Electric Powered Entrance Door B50360M000 $919.00 25.00% $689.00
Extended Length Body 051MS $2,045.00 25.00% $1,534.00
White Roof D50610F041 $662.00 25.00% $497.00
Tinted Glass B161101041 $140.00 25.00% $105.00
Seat Belt Ready Seat Frames B641539000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Seat Belts(each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door)* B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door)* B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Sure-Lok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
14,200 GVWR (includes chassis) B548969000 $3,062.00 25.00% $2,297.00
*Requires Extended Body Option
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type A 24 Passenger Gas

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
AM/FM CD Player B260401100 $552.00 25.00% $414.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401101 $606.00 25.00% $455.00
Exterior Speaker for PA B258005000 $161.00 25.00% $121.00
Child Reminder System B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Electric Powered Entrance Door B50360MO000 $919.00 25.00% $689.00
Extended Length Body 051MS $2,045.00 25.00% $1,534.00
White Roof D50610F041 5662.00 25.00% $497.00
Tinted Glass B161101041 $140.00 25.00% $105.00
Seat Belt Ready Seat Frames B641539000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Seat Belts(each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door)* B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door)* B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Sure-Lok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
14,200 GVWR (includes chassis) B548969000 $3,062.00 25.00% $2,297.00
*Requires Extended Body Option
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type A 24 Passenger Diesel

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
AM/FM CD Player B260401100 $552.00 25.00% $414.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401101 $606.00 25.00% $455.00
Exterior Speaker for PA B258005000 $161.00 25.00% $121.00
Child Reminder System B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Electric Powered Entrance Door B50360MO000 $919.00 25.00% $689.00
Extended Length Body 051MS $2,045.00 25.00% $1,534.00
White Roof D50610F041 $662.00 25.00% $497.00
Tinted Glass B161101041 $140.00 25.00% $105.00
Seat Belt Ready Seat Frames B641539000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Seat Belts(each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door)* B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door)* B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Sure-Lok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
14,200 GVYWR (includes chassis) B548969000 $3,062.00 25.00% $2,297.00
*Requires Extended Body Option
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




YIRGINIA'S BUS COMPANY

VIRGINIA SCHOOL BUSES

Contract No. E194-1413
Commonwealth of Virginia
Department of General Services
Price Bid

$ Type C Pricing
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Type C Pricing

1. Option Description
(17,500)

: Type C1 Bus 30

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
No Bid

1110 20
No Bid

21to 50
No Bid

50 +
No Bid

2. Option Description
{21,000)

: Type C Bus 35

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
$72,369.00

111020
$71,369.00

21to 50
$70,369.00

50 +
$69,369.00

3. Option Description
(25,000)

: Type C Bus 53

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

11010
$74,345.00

11t0 20
$73,345.00

21to 50
$72,345.00

50 +
$71,345.00

4. Option Description
(27,500)

: Type C Bus 65

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
$76,816.00

11 to 20
$75,816.00
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2110 50
$74,816.00

50 +
$73,816.00




5. Option Description: Type C Bus 71
(29,000)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$77,664.00

11t0 20
$76,664.00

21 to 50
$75,664.00

50 +
$74,664.00

6. Option Description: Type C Bus 77
(31,000)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

1to 10 11to 20 21to 50 50 +
Price Per Bus $80,066.00 $79,066.00 $78,066.00 $77,066.00
Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount
OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW
Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50

Instructions: The Option Items can be submitted on a separate Excel spreadsheet using the head titles above.
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Type C 35 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator FL-124-1EO $214.00 25.00% $161.00
270 Amp Alternator FL-124-1AB $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering FL-532-002 $478.00 25.00% $359.00
Tilt Steering Column FL-532-009 $292.00 25.00% $219.00
Rear Air Ride FL-622-284 $409.00 25.00% $307.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) FL-138-011 $159.00 25.00% $119.00
Mud Flaps D1088-00-003 $57.00 25.00% $43.00
Mud & Snow Tires FL-094-1T4 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B1069-00-002 $653.00 25.00% $490.00
AM/FM CD PA D1069-00-003 $706.00 25.00% $530.00
Exterior Speaker D1066-00-003 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder D4030-00-000 $203.00 25.00% $152.00
Air Door D3024-04-000 $275.00 25.00% $206.00
Vandalock D3039-11-000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
White Roof D5060-1E-170 $558.00 25.00% $419.00
Tinted Glass D7007-00-170 $255.00 25.00% $191.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $480.00 25.00% $360.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-013 $7,528.00 25.00% $5,646.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-003 $7,607.00 25.00% $5,705.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-016 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-006 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
Full Air Brakes FL-018-002 $1,661.00 25.00% $1,246.00

Any Unpriced Option

25.00%




Type C 53 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator FL-124-1EQ $214.00 25.00% $161.00
270 Amp Alternator FL-124-1AB $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering FL-532-002 $478.00 25.00% $359.00
Tilt Steering Column FL-532-009 $292.00 25.00% $219.00
Rear Air Ride FL-622-284 $409.00 25.00% $307.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) FL-138-011 $159.00 25.00% $119.00
Mud Flaps D1088-00-003 $57.00 25.00% $43.00
Mud & Snow Tires FL-094-1T4 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B1069-00-002 $653.00 25.00% $490.00
AM/FM CD PA D1069-00-003 $706.00 25.00% $530.00
Exterior Speaker D1066-00-003 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder D4030-00-000 $203.00 25.00% $152.00
Air Door D3024-04-000 $275.00 25.00% $206.00
Vandalock D3035-11-000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
White Roof D5060-1E-221 $583.00 25.00% $437.00
Tinted Glass D7007-00-221 $330.00 25.00% $248.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $720.00 25.00% $540.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-013 $7,528.00 25.00% $5,646.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-003 $7,607.00 25.00% $5,705.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-016 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-006 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
Full Air Brakes FL-018-002 $1,661.00 25.00% $1,246.00

Any Unpriced Option

25.00%




Type C 65 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator FL-124-1EO $214.00 25.00% $161.00
270 Amp Alternator FL-124-1AB $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering FL-532-002 $478.00 25.00% $359.00
Tilt Steering Column FL-532-009 $292.00 25.00% $219.00
Rear Air Ride FL-622-284 $409.00 25.00% $307.00
Block Heater {Includes Weatherproof Plug) FL-138-011 $159.00 25.00% $119.00
Mud Flaps D1088-00-003 $57.00 25.00% $43.00
Mud & Snow Tires FL-094-1T4 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B1069-00-002 $653.00 25.00% $490.00
AM/FM CD PA D1069-00-003 $706.00 25.00% $530.00
Exterior Speaker D1066-00-003 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder D4030-00-000 $203.00 25.00% $152.00
Air Door D3024-04-000 $275.00 25.00% $206.00
Vandalock D3039-11-000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
White Roof D5060-1E-281 $583.00 25.00% $437.00
Tinted Glass D7007-00-281 $420.00 25.00% $315.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $880.00 25.00% $660.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-013 $7,528.00 25.00% $5,646.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-003 $7,607.00 25.00% $5,705.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-016 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-006 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank FL-230-003 $634.00 25.00% $476.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type C 71 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator FL-124-1EOD $214.00 25.00% $161.00
270 Amp Alternator FL-124-1AB $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering FL-532-002 $478.00 25.00% $359.00
Tilt Steering Column FL-532-009 $292.00 25.00% $219.00
Rear Air Ride FL-622-284 $409.00 25.00% $307.00
Block Heater {Includes Weatherproof Plug) FL-138-011 $159.00 25.00% $119.00
Mud Flaps D1088-00-003 $57.00 25.00% $43.00
Mud & Snow Tires FL-094-1T4 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B1069-00-002 $653.00 25.00% $490.00
AM/FM CD PA D1069-00-003 $706.00 25.00% $530.00
Exterior Speaker D1066-00-003 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder D4030-00-000 $203.00 25.00% $152.00
Air Door D3024-04-000 $275.00 25.00% $206.00
Vandalock D3039-11-000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
White Roof D5060-1E-310 $633.00 25.00% $475.00
Tinted Glass D7007-00-310 $465.00 25.00% $349.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $960.00 25.00% $720.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-013 $7,528.00 25.00% $5,646.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-003 $7,607.00 25.00% $5,705.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-016 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-006 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank FL-230-003 $634.00 25.00% $476.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type C 77 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator FL-124-1EQ $214.00 25.00% $161.00
270 Amp Alternator FL-124-1AB $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering FL-532-002 $478.00 25.00% $359.00
Tilt Steering Column FL-532-009 $292.00 25.00% $219.00
Rear Air Ride FL-622-284 $409.00 25.00% $307.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) FL-138-011 $159.00 25.00% $119.00
Mud Flaps D1088-00-003 $57.00 25.00% $43.00
Mud & Snow Tires FL-094-1T4 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B1069-00-002 $653.00 25.00% $490.00
AM/FM CD PA D1069-00-003 $706.00 25.00% $530.00
Exterior Speaker D1066-00-003 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder D4030-00-000 $203.00 25.00% $152.00
Air Door D3024-04-000 $275.00 25.00% $206.00
Vandalock D3039-11-000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
White Roof D5060-1E-340 $683.00 25.00% $512.00
Tinted Glass D7007-00-340 $510.00 25.00% $383.00
Selt Ready Seats B641535000 $1,040.00 25.00% $780.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-013 $7,528.00 25.00% $5,646.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) D1164-00-003 $7,607.00 25.00% $5,705.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-016 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown D1179-00-006 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank FL-230-003 $634.00 25.00% $476.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%
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YIRGINIA'S BUS COMPANY

VIRGINIA SCHOOL BUSES

Contract No. E194-1413

Commonwealth of Virginia
Department of General Services
Price Bid

+ Type D (Rear) Pricing




Type D (Rear) Pricing

1. Option Description: Type D Bus 66
(29,800) Rear Engine Transit Bus

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$98,425.00

1110 20
$97,425.00

21to 50
$96,425.00

50 +
$95,425.00

2. Option Description: Type D Bus 72
(29,800) Rear Engine Transit Bus

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$99,022.00

11 to 20
$98,022.00

21to 50
$97,022.00

50 +
$96,022.00

3. Option Description: Type D Bus 738
(33,000) Rear Engine Transit Bus

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
$104,105.00

11 to 20
$103,105.00

21to 50
$102,105.00

50 +
$101,105.00

4. Option Description: Type D Bus 84
(33,000) Rear Engine Transit Bus

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$104,650.00

11t0 20
$103,650.00

21to 50
$102,650.00

50 +
$101,650.00
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Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount
OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW
Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50

Instructions: The Option Items can be submitted on a separate Excel spreadsheet using the head titles above.

See Separate Attached Spreadsheet
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Type D (Rear) 66 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering C422002000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) 231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires €526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $252.00 25.00% $189.00
White Roof B50601F110 $737.00 25.00% $553.00
Tinted Glass B161101110 $369.00 25.00% $277.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $880.00 25.00% $660.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336505000 $166.00 25.00% $125.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Rear) 72 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering C422002000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Rear Air Ride 440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) €231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires C526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $252.00 25.00% $189.00
White Roof B50601F120 $787.00 25.00% $590.00
Tinted Glass B161101120 $399.00 25.00% $299.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $960.00 25.00% $720.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336505000 $166.00 25.00% $125.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Rear) 78 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C€135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering (Std) 422002000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) 231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires C526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $252.00 25.00% $189.00
White Roof B50601F130 $787.00 25.00% $590.00
Tinted Glass B161101130 $428.00 25.00% $321.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $1,040.00 25.00% $780.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q/'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336505000 $166.00 25.00% $125.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Rear) 84 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering C422002000 $0.00 25.00% $0.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) C231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires 526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $252.00 25.00% $189.00
White Roof B50601F140 $787.00 25.00% $590.00
Tinted Glass B161101140 $457.00 25.00% $343.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $1,120.00 25.00% $840.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336505000 $166.00 25.00% $125.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




YIRGINIA'S BUS COMPANY

VIRGINIA SCHOOL BUSES

Contract No. E194-1413

Commonwealth of Virginia
Department of General Services
Price Bid

 Type D (Front) Pricing




Type D (Front) Pricing

1. Option Description: Type D Bus 42
(Front Engine Transit Bus)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
$89,963.00

11to 20
$88,963.00

21 to 50
$87,963.00

50 +
$86,963.00

2. Option Description: Type D Bus 53
(Front Engine Transit Bus)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$90,489.00

1110 20
$89,489.00

21to 50
$88,489.00

50 +
$87,489.00

3. Opfion Description: Type D Bus 65
(Front Engine Transit Bus)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to 10
$91,155.00

11t0 20
$90,155.00

21to 50
$89,155.00

50 +
$88,155.00

4. Opfion Description: Type D Bus 71
(Front Engine Transit Bus)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1t0 10
$91,898.00

1110 20
$90,898.00

Page1of2

21to 50
$89,898.00

50 +
$88,898.00




5. Opticn Description: Type D Bus 77
(Front Engine Transit Bus)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Price Per Bus

1to0 10
$92,981.00

11 to 20
$91,981.00

21to 50
$90,981.00

50 +
$89,981.00

[6. OptI ription: Type us 83
(Front Engine Transit Bus)

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

Volume Level

11010 11t0 20 21 to 50 50 +
Price Per Bus $98,097.00 $97,097.00 $96,097.00 $95,097.00
Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount
OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW
Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50

Instructions: The Option Items can be submitted on a separate Excel spreadsheet using the head titles above.

See Enclosed Spreadsheet

Page 2 of 2




Type D (Front) 42 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering C422002000 $319.00 25.00% $239.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) 231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires C526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $202.00 25.00% $152.00
White Roof B50601F090 $687.00 25.00% $515.00
Tinted Glass B161101090 $318.00 25.00% $239.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $560.00 25.00% $420.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Front) 53 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering 422002000 $319.00 25.00% $239.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) C231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires 526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $202.00 25.00% $152.00
White Roof B50601F101 $737.00 25.00% $553.00
Tinted Glass B161101101 $346.00 25.00% $260.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $720.00 25.00% $540.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336501000 $373.00 25.00% $280.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Front) 65 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering C€422002000 $319.00 25.00% $239.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) C231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires €526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $202.00 25.00% $152.00
White Roof B50601F110 $737.00 25.00% $553.00
Tinted Glass B161101110 $376.00 25.00% $282.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $880.00 25.00% $660.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336501000 $373.00 25.00% $280.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Front} 71 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator 135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering 422002000 $319.00 25.00% $239.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) C231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires C526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player 8260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $202.00 25.00% $152.00
White Roof B50601F120 $737.00 25.00% $553.00
Tinted Glass B161101120 $399.00 25.00% $299.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $960.00 25.00% $720.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336501000 $373.00 25.00% $280.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Front) 77 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator €13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator 135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering C422002000 $319.00 25.00% $239.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) C231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires C526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $149.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $202.00 25.00% $152.00
White Roof B50601F130 $787.00 25.00% $590.00
Tinted Glass B161101130 $443.00 25.00% $332.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $1,040.00 25.00% $780.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C336501000 $373.00 25.00% $280.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




Type D (Front) 83 Passenger

Option Description Option Code List Price Discount % Contract Amount

OPTIONAL ITEMS LIST BELOW

Sample: Premium Wheels JKH56 $625.00 10.00% $562.50
200 Amp Alternator C13540000 $1,180.00 25.00% $885.00
270 Amp Alternator C135401000 $1,638.00 25.00% $1,229.00
Tilt/Telescopic Steering 422002000 $319.00 25.00% $239.00
Rear Air Ride C440501000 $1,739.00 25.00% $1,304.00
Block Heater (Includes Weatherproof Plug) C€231600000 $223.00 25.00% $167.00
Mud Flaps B564102000 $81.00 25.00% $61.00
Mud & Snow Tires C526002000 $196.00 25.00% $147.00
AM/FM CD Player B260401300 $773.00 25.00% $580.00
AM/FM CD PA B260401301 $817.00 25.00% $613.00
Exterior Speaker C258000000 $145.00 25.00% $112.00
Child Reminder B200113000 $128.00 25.00% $96.00
Air Door B503501829 $535.00 25.00% $401.00
Vandalock B518200000 $202.00 25.00% $152.00
White Roof B50601F140 $787.00 25.00% $590.00
Tinted Glass B161101140 $457.00 25.00% $343.00
Selt Ready Seats B641539000 $1,120.00 25.00% $840.00
Seat Belts (each) B623001196 $19.00 25.00% $14.00
Ricon Lift Package (includes door) B704827000 $7,500.00 25.00% $5,625.00
Braun Lift Package (includes door) B7060MR919 $7,412.00 25.00% $5,559.00
Surelok Retractable Tiedown B714121000 $436.00 25.00% $327.00
Q'Straint Retractable Tiedown B708331000 $533.00 25.00% $400.00
100 Gallon Fuel Tank C361500000 $373.00 25.00% $280.00
Any Unpriced Option 25.00%




